Letting of 11/27/2018 NCDOT-DIVISIONS Bid Summary Report

Call Order 001 (DD00265)

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: NOVEMEBER 27, 2018 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00265 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
50138.3.122 FEDERAL AID NO.: HSIP-0264(061) COUNTY: WILSON COUNTY TIP NO.: W-5601DQ MILES: 0.598 MILES
ROUTE NO.: US-264 ALTERNATE LOCATION: US-264 ALTERNATE (RALEIGH ROAD PARKWAY) AND SR 1001 (LAMM
ROAD) TYPE OF WORK: GRADING, DRAINAGE AND PAVING

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$1,691,471.60 3760 XKAK-YACT-2L98-T9SF S T WOOTEN CORPORATION
$1,693,961.00 5072 SNC18970993 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY
$1,768,237.05 3123 LQPX-E5UA-U6LH-XTTJ PLT CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

Call Order 002 (DD00277)

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: November 27, 2018 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00277 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
17BP.4.C.2 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: HALIFAX COUNTY TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 0.1 MILES ROUTE
NO.: SR 1001 LOCATION: JUSTICE BRANCH RD OVER BUTTERWOOD CREEK TYPE OF WORK: GRADING, PAVING,
UTILITIES, CULVERT

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$618,518.03 3759 5BV5 - 4HPE - KKGB - X4BA RALPH HODGE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
$636,362.50 15979 SNC18378583 BRIDGEPOINT CIVIL LLC
$747,884.50 3238 99WN-RLP8-3WRT-2HRK ROSE BROTHERS PAVING CO INC
$771,100.00 5072 SNC18525470 FSC II LLC DBA FRED SMITH COMPANY
$885,602.00 3413 SNC18156659 RPC CONTRACTING INC

Call Order 004 (DD00283)

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: November 27, 2018 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00283 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
2019CPT.04.17.10332, 2019CPT.04.17.20332, 2019CPT.04.17.10422, 2019CPT.04.17.20422 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE
FUNDED COUNTY: EDGECOMBE & HALIFAX COUNTIES TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 63.58 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS
LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK: CRACK SEALING

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$189,510.92 11922 No Bid Bond ID I;?S-Il_—(igAST SEAL COATING & STRIPING
$221,293.20 3304 No Bid Bond ID FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC
$227,270.66 5907 No Bid Bond ID ANNSEAL OF PA INC
$249,272.80 2903 No Bid Bond ID SLURRY PAVERS INC
$380,268.20 10932 No Bid Bond ID SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
$502,361.00 2434 No Bid Bond ID DELTA CONTRACTING INC

Call Order 005 (DD00284)

DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: November 27, 2018 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00284 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
2019CPT.04.18.20642, 2019CPT.04.18.10981, 2019CPT.04.18.20982 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: NASH &
WILSON COUNTIES TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 55.67 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK:
CRACK SEALING

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$167,006.13 11922 No Bid Bond ID IJE:?SIEgAST SEAL COATING & STRIPING
$171,448.20 3304 No Bid Bond ID FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC
$188,815.68 5907 No Bid Bond ID ANNSEAL OF PA INC
$228,226.50 2903 No Bid Bond ID SLURRY PAVERS INC
$332,876.70 10932 No Bid Bond ID SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
$384,088.50 2434 No Bid Bond ID DELTA CONTRACTING INC
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Call Order 006 (DD00285)
DATE AND TIME OF BID OPENING: November 27, 2018 AT 2:00 PM CONTRACT ID: DD00285 WBS ELEMENT NO.:
2019CPT.04.19.20512, 2019CPT.04.19.20962 FEDERAL AID NO.: STATE FUNDED COUNTY: JOHNSTON & WAYNE
COUNTIES TIP NO.: N/A MILES: 50.53 MILES ROUTE NO.: VARIOUS LOCATION: VARIOUS TYPE OF WORK: CRACK

NCDOT-DIVISIONS Bid Summary Report

SEALING

Bid Amount Bidder ID Bond ID Vendor Name
$146,545.70 3304 No Bid Bond ID FULFORD AND JONES ASPHALT INC
$151,599.00 11922 No Bid Bond ID I;?S-Il_—(igAST SEAL COATING & STRIPING
$177,775.09 5907 No Bid Bond ID ANNSEAL OF PA INC
$200,110.68 2903 No Bid Bond ID SLURRY PAVERS INC
$292,080.74 2434 No Bid Bond ID DELTA CONTRACTING INC
$302,187.34 10932 No Bid Bond ID SWANK CONSTRUCTION COMPANY LLC
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